
Bidder Name & Location Addendum 
(TWO) Signed Bid 

Guarantee
In State 
Bidder Manufacturer/Brand (Cost/Ton) (Total/1000 Tons) Addittional 

(Cost/Ton) Delivery ARO (Cost/Ton) Yr 
2

(Total/1000 Tons) 
Yr 2

Addittional 
(Cost/Ton) Yr 

2

Delivery ARO 
Yr 2

Desert Mountain Corp.  Riverton, 
WY. YES YES N/A 

(NONE) NO Ice Slicer  $        115.00  $      115,000.00  $        115.00 1-3 Days  $        115.00  $      115,000.00  $        115.00 1-3 Business 
Days

Dustbusters, Inc.  Evanston, WY. 
(Bid Rejected, did not meet all 

Bid requirements)
YES YES N/A 

(NONE) YES Broken Arrow  $        116.47  $      116,470.00  $        116.47 5 Business 
Days  $        118.47  $      118,470.00  $        118.47 5 Business 

Days

GMCO Corporation.  Rifle, CO. YES YES N/A 
(NONE) NO Torch RT (Rapid 

Thaw)  $        120.00  $      120,000.00  $        120.00 5-10 Days  $        121.00  $      121,000.00  $        121.00 5-10 days

Morton Salt, Chicago, IL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Compass Minerals.  Overland 
Park, KS.

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CITY OF CHEYENNE - PURCHASING
BID TABULATION

MUNICIPAL BUILDING, 2101 O'NEIL AVE, ROOM 309, CHEYENNE, WYOMING 82001
CITY OF CHEYENNE, PURCHASING MANAGER, PHONE: (307) 773-1045, EMAIL: TBARTTELBORT@CHEYENNECITY.ORG

INQUIRIES REGARDING THIS BID SHOULD BE DIRECTED TO:

Ice Control Product, for the City of Cheyenne Street & Alley Division

BID NUMBER: E-7-21
Bid Opening:  October 8, 2020

Year One (Fall 2020) Year Two (Fall 2021)


